
OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

OAMARU GAOL STABLES 

Location – First right off Steward St. and in the hospital carpark. 
 
Planting began in 1991 around the Old Gaol Stables with cuttings grown by members of the North 
Otago Rose Society.  Over the years there have been some changes but much of the original 
planting still remains.  Members of the North Otago Rose Society prune and weed the roses on a 
roster system. 
 

 
  



OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

WAIKOUAITI PUBLIC GARDEN 

Location – SH 1 opposite Mount Street, Waikouaiti 
 
This planting was established in 1999 with donations from Gwen Pullar; and further heritage roses 
were donated in 2000.  The rugosa roses border the public footpath with a stone wall separating 
the planting from the public. 
 
 

 
 



 

  



OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

OTAGO COMMUNITY HOSPICE 

Location – 293 North Rd. North East Valley, Dunedin 
 
A collection of hybrid musks were donated to the Hospice in 2002 by Heritage Roses Otago. The 
roses are planted together in a bed bordered with a buxus hedge. The ongoing care and 
maintenance of these roses is the responsibility of HRO members. 
 
 

 
  
  

https://maps.google.com/?q=293+North+Rd.+North+East+Valley,+Dunedin&entry=gmail&source=g


OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

COLUMA COLLEGE – 'Nancy Steen Memorial Garden'  

Location – 399 Highgate, Maori Hill, Dunedin  
 

Nancy Steen was a past pupil of Columba College and a first year student when the boarding 
sector began. To recognise the research and promotional work on heritage roses by Nancy Steen, 
a new garden was created at the time of the first national heritage roses in Dunedin in 2012. All 
roses were gifted by heritage rose members and a plaque was unveiled. 
 
  

  



OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

DUNEDIN NORTHERN CEMETERY 

Location – Lovelock Ave, Dunedin 
 
This Victorian Garden Cemetery has been rejuvenated by members of Heritage Roses Otago with 
the planting of over 1200 heritage roses. The project began as a gift to the city to mark the 
millennium, and has continued for the past 17 years with all care and maintenance carried out by 
members. 
 
Close liaison with the Dunedin City Council and HRO members has led to the creation of NZ's 
largest public collection of heritage roses which are recognised as being an internationally 
significant collection.  The spectacular display from November to April or May is well worth a visit. 
 
   

 
 

 
 
 



  



OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

DUNEDIN RAILWAY STATION 

Location – Address: Anzac Avenue, Dunedin 
 
HRO's first gift of heritage roses to the city of Dunedin in the year 2000. A collection of roses were 
planted to show case blooms and hips, especially the hips of R. moyseii against the background of 
local bluestone. These roses are cared for by HRO members.  
  

  



OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

GLENFALLOCH 

Location – 430 Portobello Rd. Macandrew Bay, Dunedin 
 
HRO have advised and donated roses over the past 20 years. 
 
 

 
  
 
  
  

https://maps.google.com/?q=430+Portobello+Rd.+Macandrew+Bay,+Dunedin+9077&entry=gmail&source=g


OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

OTAGO UNIVERSITY 

Location – Saint David St Bridge 
 
A planting of heritage roses donated by Rex Thomson in 2005 for the 10th International Heritage 
Rose Conference with lovely examples of Dupontii and woodsii fendlerii. 
 
 

 
  
  



OTAGO HERITAGE ROSES TRAIL 

DUNEDIN BOTANIC ROSE GARDEN 

Location – 12 Opoho Road, North Dunedin 
 
Dunedin Botanic Garden Rose Garden displays some of the earliest discovered species through to 
the latest cultivars.  This collection is grouped into easy reference beds – species, old garden and 
modern roses. 
 
 

 
 


